DELINQUENT TAX SALE
HILL COUNTY APPRAISAL DISTRICT, THE COUNTY OF HILL, TEXAS, THE CITY OF ITASCA, TEXAS, HILLSBORO
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT AND CITY OF HILLSBORO
HILL COUNTY, TEXAS

November 3, 2015 at 10:00 A.M.
Hill County Courthouse Steps; Hillsboro, Texas

GENERAL INFORMATION REGARDING THE TAX SALE

You must READ THE FOLLOWING IMPORTANT INFORMATION regarding the property to be offered for sale.

Prior to the beginning of the tax sale, a person intending to bid is required to register with the person conducting
the sale and present a valid Driver’s License or identification card issued by a State agency or the United States
government.

The property will be sold at public auction and will be sold for cash to the highest bidder, based on oral bids.
Successful bidders must pay for their property with cash or a cashier’s check payable to Hill County Tax Office. Any
bidder who fails to make payment shall be held liable for twenty percent of the value of the property plus costs
incurred as a result of the bidder’s default pursuant to Rule 652 of the Texas Rules of Civil Procedure.

The amount of the opening bid is set out below each tract, and the bidding must start at that figure or higher, and
sums less than the given figure cannot be accepted. The minimum bid amount includes taxes which were
delinquent at the date of judgment.

Purchasers at this tax foreclosure sale will receive an ordinary type of Sheriff's Deed which is WITHOUT WARRANTY,
express or implied. Title to property is NOT guaranteed. A policy of title insurance may be difficult to obtain.

All property purchased at this sale is subject to a statutory right of redemption. This redemption period commences
to run from the date the purchaser’s deed is filed for record in the deed records. There is a two year right of
redemption for homestead property and property appraised as agricultural land. There is a 180 day right of
redemption for all other property. Purchasers have a right of possession beginning twenty days after the
purchaser’s deed is filed in the deed records (Sec. 33.51 Tax Code).

Anyone having an ownership interest in the property at the time of the sale may redeem the property from the
purchaser during the redemption period. The redemption price is set by the Texas Tax Code as follows: purchase
amount, deed recording fee, taxes paid by purchaser after the tax sale, and costs expended on the property, plus a
redemption premium of 25 percent of the aggregate total during the first year or 50 percent of the aggregate total
during the second year. “Costs” are only the reasonable expenses incurred by the purchaser for the maintenance,
preservation and safekeeping of the property. Do NOT make unnecessary repairs or renovations during the
redemption period.

Property is sold by legal description. Bidders must satisfy themselves concerning the location and condition of the
property on the ground, including the existence of improvements on the property, prior to this tax sale. Property is
sold “AS IS” with all faults. All sales are final. There are no refunds. Deeds, maps and plats of the properties are in
the County Clerk’s office or the Appraisal District. Lawsuit files on which this sale is based are in the office of the
District Clerk. Any property address reflected on the bid sheet is the address on the tax records and may not be
accurate.

Property purchased at this tax sale may be subject to liens for demolition, mowing, or maintenance fees due to the
City or Property Owners Association in which the property is located.

If you have any questions, please contact our office in Waco at (254) 756-7755.



PROPERTIES

TO BE SOLD ON NOVEMBER 3, 2015:

TRACT

SUIT #

STYLE

PROPERTY DESCRIPTION, APPROXIMATE
ADDRESS, ACCT #

MIN BID

10599A

Hubbard Independent
School District v Carol
Lynn Wooldridge et al

Lots 6, 7 and 8, Block 69, Original Townsite, City of
Hubbard, Hill County, Texas (Volume 1074, Page 570,
Deed Records, Hill County, Texas), 500 NW 1st St and

a Fleetwood Manufactured home
Account #000000117438, 000000155204
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2009

WITHDRAWN

10712A

Hillsboro Independent
School District v J.C.
Riggs aka James
Charles Riggs Et Al

Part of Lot 67, McMullen Addition to the City of
Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas, assessed on the tax rolls
as Lot 15, Block 67, McMullen Addition, City of
Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 394, Page 593
and Volume 368, Page 565, Deed Records, Hill
County, Texas), 117 Sycamore Street
Account #000000103902
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2010

WITHDRAWN

10808A

Hillsboro Independent
School District v
Randall W. Ballew

12.5 feet of Lot 22 and all of Lot 23, Block 3, Moore
Addition to the City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas
(Volume 1479, Page 740, Official Public Records, Hill
County, Texas), 100 BRAZOS ST
Account #000000114164
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2012

SOLD
$39,500.00

11233A

Hillsboro Independent
School District et al v
Johnie Lee Wilson et al

Lot B, Dalton Addition to the City of Hillsboro, a
Resubdivision of Lots 18-22, Sweeney Addition to the
City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 765,
Page 248 of the Deed Records, Hill County, Texas),
429 Dalton
Account #000000112324

Judgment Through Tax Year: 2012

WITHDRAWN




11316A Hillsboro Independent Lot 7, Block 15, Steiner Donation, City of Hillsboro, SOLD
School District v Elijah Hill County, Texas (Volume 806, Page 227 of the $1,650.00
A. Jackson et al Official Public Records, Hill County, Texas), 113
Smith Street, Hillsboro, Texas 76645-2121
Account #000000114712
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2012
11365A Hill County Appraisal | part of the J.A. Caruthers Survey, assessed on the Tax | WITHDRAWN
District v Robernette Roll as Lots 10 and 11, Block 60, McMullen Addition
Johnson Kelley et al to the City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume
404, Page 17 of the Deed Records, Hill County,
Texas), 411 Peabody, Hillsboro, Texas 76645
Account #000000114036
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
11365A Hill County Appraisal Lot 6, Block 67, McMullen Addition to the City of WITHDRAWN

District v Robernette
Johnson Kelley et al

Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 213, Page 25 of
the Official Public Records, Hill County, Texas), 312
Brown Street, Hillsboro, Texas 76645-3416
Account #000000114115
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

‘ ]

11506A

City of Whitney et al v
Jerry Wayne Moore,
Individually and DBA

Speedway Towing et al

Lot 157, Tall Timber Estates, Unit 2, Subdivision, Hill
County, Texas (Volume 1013, Page 28, Deed Records,
Hill County, Texas), 128 Reagan Road, Whitney,
Texas 76692-4914
Account #000000130188
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

} )

WITHDRAWN

Mount Calm
Independent School
District v Jason Wayne
Fulton

Lots 3 and 4, Block 14, Original Town of Mount Calm,
Hill County, Texas (Volume 1674, Page 275, Official
Public Records, Hill County, Texas), 111 North 4th
Street, Mount Calm, Texas 76673
Account #000000123378

WITHDRAWN




10.

11.

11552A

11591A

Hillsboro Independent
School District v Hattie
Mayberry et al

Hillsboro Independent

East half of Lot 5, Parks Addition, to the City of

of the Official Public Records, Hill County, Texas),
714 E Franklin
Account #000000114231
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 1658, Page 630

WITHDRAWN

12.

11591A

School District et al v
Hal C. Ridlehuber et al

Lot 1 and 1/2 of 15 feet Alley, Block 7, Rose Hill
Addition, to the City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas
(Volume 745, Page 544 of the Deed Records, Hill
County, Texas), 610 Abbott Avenue, Hillsboro, Texas
76645-2812
Account #000000114494
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014; Lot 2, Block 7,
Rose Hill Addition, to the City of Hillsboro, Hill
County, Texas (Volume 745, Page 544, of the Deed
Records, Hill County, Texas), 610 Abbott Avenue,
Hillsboro, Texas 76645-2812
Account #000000114495
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

SOLD
$26,000.00

13.

11591A

Hillsboro Independent
School District et al v
Hal C. Ridlehuber et al

Part of Lot 97, Craig Addition, to the City of Hillsboro,
Hill County, Texas, being assessed on the tax rolls as
Lot 97A, Craig Addition, to the City of Hillsboro, Hill
County, Texas (Volume 1176, Page 433, of the Deed
Records, Hill County, Texas), 619 E. Franklin,
Hillsboro, Texas 76645-2216
Account #000000112266
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

WITHDRAWN

Hillsboro Independent
School District et al v

Part of Lot 10, Block 4, Original Townsite City of

Hal C. Ridlehuber et al

Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas, assessed on the tax rolls

as Lot 10B, Block 4, Original Townsite City of

Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 1585, Page 349

and Volume 699, Page 758, of the Deed Records, Hill

County, Texas), 129 S. Waco, Hillshoro, Texas 76645
Account #000000113022

Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

SOLD
$8,500.00




14, 11591A Hillsboro Independent | Business Personal Property, used in the operation of J | WITHDRAWN
School District et al v & R Coating, City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas,
Hal C. Ridlehuber et al 610 Abbott Avenue, Hillshoro, Texas 76645-2812
Account #000000147872
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
15. 11627A Hillsboro Independent Lot 21-R Shelton's Park Addition to the City of WITHDRAWN
School District et al v Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Slide 301A, Plat
Billy F. Morgan et al Records, Hill County, Texas), 210 W Madison St,
Hillsboro, Texas 76645-3518
Account #000000114599
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

16.

11693A

Mount Calm
Independent School
District et al v Joel

Rodriguez et al

Lots 9 and 10, Block 20, Original Townsite to the City
of Mount Calm, Hill County, Texas and a
Manufactured Home, Marlette, 28 feet x 52 feet, Label
#RAD1084602/01, Serial #MN225943A/B (Volume
864, Page 111 of the Official Public Records, Hill
County, Texas), 110 N. 2nd Street W, Mount Calm,
Texas 76673
Account #000000101006
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

WITHDRAWN

11757A

Hillsboro Independent

Lots 7B and

B, Block 56, McMullen Addition to the

WITHDRAWN

17.
School District et al v City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 1156,
Ollie P. McGill, Jr. Page 827 of the Deed Records, Hill County, Texas),
210 Gooden, Hillsboro, Texas 76645
Account #000000107319
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
18. 11757A Hillsboro Independent Lot 16, Block 60, McMullen Addition to the City of WITHDRAWN

School District et al v
Ollie P. McGill, Jr.

Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 1427, Page 324
of the Official Public Records, Hill County, Texas),
402 Peabody Street, Hillsboro, Texas 76645
Account #000000102146
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014




19. 11757A Hillsboro Independent Lot 24, Block 60, McMullen Addition to the City of WITHDRAWN
School District et al v | Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 1416, Page 700
Ollie P. McGill, Jr. of the Official Public Records, Hill County, Texas),
307 Brown Street, Hillsboro, Texas 76645
Account #000000114042
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
20. 11757A Hillsboro Independent Lot 3A, Block 61, McMullen Addition to the City of WITHDRAWN
School District et al v | Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 1156, Page 824
Ollie P. McGill, Jr. of the Official Public Records, Hill County, Texas),
230 McDonald, Hillshoro, Texas 76645
Account #000000102507
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
21. 11757A Hillsboro Independent Lot 3B, Block 61, McMullen Addition to the City of WITHDRAWN
School Districtetal v | Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 1136, Page 826
Ollie P. McGill, Jr. of the Official Public Records, Hill County, Texas),
232 McDonald, Hillshoro, Texas 76645
Account #000000114048
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
22. 11757A Hillsboro Independent Lot 30B, Sweeney Addition to the City of Hillsboro, WITHDRAWN
School District et al v Hill County, Texas (Volume 1136, Page 824 of the
Ollie P. McGill, Jr. Official Public Records, Hill County, Texas), 222 3rd
Street, Hillsboro, Texas 76645
Account #000000105215
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
23. 11778A Hillsboro Independent | 0.234 Acre, more or less, out of Abstract 403 of the J. | WITHDRAWN

School District et al v
St. Paphnutius The
Great, a Catholic
Church

Hanley Survey, Tract 9, Lot 25, City of Hillsboro, Hill
County, Texas (Volume 1680, Page 278 of the Official
Public Records, Hill County, Texas), 806 Corsicana
Highway, Hillsboro, Texas 76645-2926
Account #000000113456
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014




24. 11804A Itasca Independent Lots 5 and 6, Block 2, Original Townsite of Osceola, SOLD
School District et al v Hill County, Texas (Volume 1469, Page 307, of the $2,600.00
Gary L. Melson et al Official Public Records, Hill County, Texas), 111
bAKER aVE
Account #000000119851
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
25. 11808A Hubbard Independent Lot 6, Block 92, Original Townsite to the City of WITHDRAWN
School District et al v Hubbard, Hill County, Texas (Volume 733, Page 817
Esterlene Hawkins et al | of the Deed Records, Hill County, Texas), 204 SW 3rd
Street, Hubbard, Texas 76648-2622
Account #000000117511
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
26. 11808A Hubbard Independent | North half of Lot 8, Block 97, Original Townsite to the | WITHDRAWN
School District et al v City of Hubbard, assessed on the tax rolls as Lot 8A,
Esterlene Hawkins etal | Block 97, Original Townsite to the City of Hubbard,
Hill County, Texas (Volume 443, Page 264 of the Deed
Records, Hill County, Texas), S. Cedar Street,
Hubbard, Texas
Account #000000117535
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
217. 11819A Hillsboro Independent Part of Lot 7, Block 3, Duncan Addition, City of WITHDRAWN

School District v Jesus
Zuniga Cardenas

Hillsboro, assessed on the tax rolls as Lot 7A, Block 3,
Duncan Addition, to the City of Hillsboro, Hill County,
Texas (Volume 1192, Page 578, of the Official Public
Records, Hill County, Texas), 215 Duncan, Hillsboro,
Texas
Account #000000112384
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

28.

11852A

Hillsboro Independent
School District et al v
George McGuire et al

0.50 Acre, more or less, out of Abstract 755 of the H.
Ross Survey, Tract 103, Hill County, Texas (Volume
454, Page 42. of the Deed Records, Hill County,
Texas), HCR 3102 and HCR 3103, Hillsoboro, Texas
Account #103131
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

SOLD
$3,680.00




WITHDRAWN

29.

11865A

Hillsboro Independent
School District v
Christina Tompkins

Memon

18.926 Acres, more or less, out of Abstract 379, of the
J. Hillburn Survey, Tract 4, Hill County, Texas
(Volume 1744, Page 580, of the Official Public

Records, Hill County, Texas), 1021 HCR 2421 E,
Hillsboro, Texas 76645-5178
Account #110343
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

RESALES

THE FOLLOWING PROPERTIES HELD IN TRUST BY THE TAXING UNITS LISTED BELOW ARE OFFERED

FOR SALE
PURSUANT TOSECTION 34.05 OF THE TEXAS PROPERTY TAX CODE:

Part of Lot 67, McMullen Addition to the City of

SOLD
$500.00

31.

School District et al v

sboro Independent

ly F. Morgan et al 67,
County, Texas (Volume 1240, Page 132 of the Official
Public Records, Hill County, Texas), 201 Madison,

Hillsboro, assessed on the tax rolls as Lot 19A, Block

McMullen Addition to the City of Hillsboro, Hill

Hillsboro, Texas 76645
Account #000000114117
Bid in Trust 5/5/2015
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014

Part of Lot 30, Sweeney Addition to the City of

NO BID
$500.00

32.

School District etal v
Vernon Uzell Baker et

illsboro Independent

al H

Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas, assessed on the tax rolls
as Lot 30G, Sweeney Addition to the City of Hillsboro,

Records, Hill County, Texas), 112 Sweeney, Hillsboro,

ill County, Texas (Volume 305, Page 15 of the Deed

Texas 76645-3383
Account #000000100214
Bid in Trust 8/5/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2013

NO BID
$700.00

33.

11627A Hill

Bil

11232A H
10664A

Hubbard Independent
School District v
Rudolph McKinney (In
Rem Only) Et Al

0.75 of an acre, more or less, out of Abstract 42 of the
J. Beasley Survey, Tract 22, City of Hubbard, Hill
County, Texas (Volume 576, Page 711, D.R., Hill

County, Texas)
Account #000000105639
Bid in Trust 10/4/2011
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2010




34. 11035A Hillsboro Independent 50 feet x 145 and one-fifth feet being part of Lot 29, NO BID
School District v Sweeney Addition to the City of Hillsboro, assessed on $500.00
Oscar Isaac et al the Tax Rolls as Lot 29E, Sweeney Addition to the
City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 354,
Page 223 of the Deed Records, Hill Country, Texas),
McDonald Street & Pine Street, Hillsboro, Texas
Account #000000100225
Bid in Trust 4/3/2012
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2010
35. 10771A Hillsboro Independent | Lot 29C-1, Sweeney Addition to the City of Hillsboro, NO BID
School District v Louis | Hill County, Texas (Volume 792, Page 773, Official $500.00
M. Hodge Public Records, Hill County, Texas), 204 Pine,
Hillsboro
Account #000000143171
Bid in Trust 11/2/2010
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2009
36. 10488A Hillsboro Independent Lot 5, Block 97, Original Townsite of the City of NO BID
School District v Sie Hubbard, Hill County, Texas (Volume 315, Page 150 $500.00
McGrew (In Rem of the Deed Records, Hill County, Texas), SW 3RD ST
Only) & S MESQUITE AVE
Account #000000117534
Bid in Trust 11/6/2012
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2011
37. 10812A Hillsboro Independent | the West one-half of Lot 26, Quickenstedt Addition to NO BID
School District v the City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 679, $2,000.00

Edward Clarence Greer
Et Al

Page 697, Deed Records, Hill County, Texas), Brown
Street
Account #000000101750
Bid in Trust 11/6/2012
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2011




38. 11224A Hubbard Independent Lot 2, Block 117, Original Townsite of the City of
School Districtetal v | Hubbard, Hill County, Texas (Volume 405, Page 89 of NO BID
Elmer Joyce Davis the Deed Records, Hill County, Texas), 203 SW 4TH $500.00
AKA Elmir Davis et al ST
Account #000000101136
Bid in Trust 11/6/2012
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2011
39. 10595A City of Whitney v Lot 6, Gilmore Subdivision, City of Whitney, Hill NO BID
Melvin Gilmore (In | County, Texas, being 60 x 100 feet known as Tract 6 of $500.00
Rem Only) Et Al the Estelle Gilmore Subdivision, SAVE AND
EXCEPT that portion conveyed for the Highway,
assessed on the tax roll as Gilmore 6 Subdivision, City
of Whitney, Hill County, Texas (Volume 408, Page
248 SAVE & EXCEPT Volume 416, Page 530, Deed
Records, Hill County, Texas)
Account #000000103031
Bid in Trust 11/5/2013
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2012
40. 10685A City of Whitney, a Lot 5, Block 2, Wallace Addition to the City of NO BID
Municipal Corporation | Whitney, Hill County, Texas (Volume 370, Page 554, $500.00
v Irine H. Williams Et | Deed Records, Hill County, Texas), 706 West Railroad
Al Account #000000131330
Bid in Trust 2/4/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2012
41, 11227A Hillsboro Independent | .08 of an acre, more or less, out of Abstract 148 of the NO BID
School District, Et Al v J. Carothers Survey, Tract 30, Lot 49, City of $500.00

Clara L. Polk

Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 420, Page 299,
D.R., Hill County, Texas)
Account #000000103705
Bid in Trust 2/4/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2012




42,

11315A

Hillsboro Independent
School District v John
A. Shields et al

Part of Lots 5 and 6, Huffhines Addition to the City of
Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas and being assessed on
the tax rolls as 5B-1 and 6C, Huffhines Addition to the
City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 670,
Page 82 Save and Except Volume 631, Page 10 and
Volume 582, Page 311 of the Deed Records and
Volume 1042, Page 403 of the Official Public Records,
Hill County, Texas), East Walnut Street
Account #000000134173
Bid in Trust 2/4/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2012

NO BID
$500.00

43.

11329A

The City of Whitney,
Texas et al v Melba
Moore et al

Lots 9 and 10, Block 31, Original Townsite to the City
of Whitney, Hill County, Texas (Volume 665, Page
120 of the Deed Records, Hill County, Texas), 204
East Lincoln Avenue, Whitney, Texas 76692-2334

Account #000000131487
Bid in Trust 2/4/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2012

NO BID
$500.00

44,

11334A

The City of Whitney,
Texas et al v Cordelia
Denise Jenkins

Lots 6 and 7, Block 77, Original Townsite to the City
of Whitney, Hill County, Texas (Volume 1114, Page
404 of the Official Public Records, Hill County,
Texas), 304 West Cleveland, Whitney, Texas 76692-
2619
Account #000000131634
Bid in Trust 2/4/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2012

SOLD
$500.00

45,

11218A

Hillsboro Independent
School District v Mary
Ella Golston Green

Lots D and E of the Shelton Addition, an unrecorded
plat, being part of Lot 67 of the McMullen Addition to
the City of Hillshboro, Hill County, Texas and being
assessed on the Hill County Tax Roll as Lot 36, Block
67, McMullen Addition to the City of Hillsboro, Hill
County, Texas (Volume 493, Page 907, D.R., Hill
County, Texas), Francis St
Account #000000101744
Bid in Trust 8/5/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2013

NO BID
$500.00




46. 11496A Hubbard Independent Lot 22, Hunt Addition, to the City of Hubbard, Hill
School District v County, Texas (Volume 357, Page 10, Deed Records, NO BID
Albert Hunt et al Hill County, Texas) $500.00
Account #000000102268
Bid in Trust 8/5/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2013
47. 11496A Hubbard Independent Lot 20, Hunt Addition, to the City of Hubbard, Hill
School District v County, Texas (Volume 162, Page 78, Deed Records, NO BID
Albert Hunt et al Hill County, Texas) $500.00
Account #000000102267
Bid in Trust 8/5/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2013
48. 11569A Hubbard Independent Lot 4, Block 104, Original Townsite to the City of NO BID
School District et al v Hubbard, Hill County, Texas (Volume 401, Page 162 $500.00
Charles L. Clark etal | of the Deed Records, Hill County, Texas), S.W. 3rd St
& S. Walnut Ave, Hubbard, Texas
Account #000000100855
Bid in Trust 8/5/2014
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2013
49, 11104A Hillsboro Independent 50 feet X 150 Feet, being part of Lot 30, Sweeney NO BID
School District v Inez | Addition to the City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas, $500.00

Baker et al

assessed on the Tax Roll as Lot 30H, Sweeney
Addition to the City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas
(Volume 709, Page 559 of the Deed Records, Hill
County, Texas), 116 Sweeney St
Account #000000104854
Bid in Trust 4/3/2012
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2010




50. 11625A Hillsboro Independent Part of Lot 62, McMullen Addition to the City of NO BID
School District et al v Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas as assessed on the tax $500.00
Mary D. Ecles rolls as Lots 21 and 22, Block 62, McMullen Addition
Simpson et al to the City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume
174, Page 515 and Volume 302, Page 59 SAVE AND
EXCEPT that property described in VVolume 1159,
Page 486 of the Deed Records, Hill County, Texas),
Corsicana Hwy
Account #000000114071
Bid in Trust 5/5/2015
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
51. 11691A Hillsboro Independent | Lot 10, Tarlton Addition to the City of Hillsboro, Hill NO BID
School District et al v County, Texas (Volume 459, Page 297 of the Deed $500.00
R. R. Hoyle et al Records, Hill County, Texas), East Madison Street,
Hillsboro, Texas
Account #000000100252
Bid in Trust 5/5/2015
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
52. 11691A Hillsboro Independent | Lot 11, Tarlton Addition to the City of Hillsboro, Hill NO BID
School District et al v County, Texas (Volume 459, Page 297 of the Deed $500.00
R. R. Hoyle et al Records, Hill County, Texas), East Madison Street,
Hillsboro, Texas
Account #000000100253
Bid in Trust 5/5/2015
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014
53. 11777A Hillsboro Independent Part of Lots 16 and 17, Shelton Park Addition to the NO BID
School District et al v City of Hillsboro, Hill County, Texas (Volume 441, $500.00

Ray O. Collier et al

Page 149 of the Deed Records, Hill County, Texas),
215 Madison, Hillsboro, Texas 76645
Account #000000114596
Bid in Trust 8/4/2015
Judgment Through Tax Year: 2014




